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150 COMPANIES TO EXHIBIT ADVANCED TECHNOLOGIES, PRODUCTS & SERVICES  
AT CEPSI 2018 

 
Around 150 companies will showcase their leading technologies, products and services at 
the 22nd Conference of The Electric Power Supply Industry (CEPSI 2018), East Asia and the 
Western Pacific’s most prominent and prestigious electricity supply industry conference 
cum exhibition. 
 
Half of the exhibitors are Malaysian companies involve in the electricity supply industry, said 
TNB Chief Corporate Officer and AESIEAP 2017/2018 Secretary General, Datuk Wira Roslan 
Ab Rahman.  
 
The remaining are from China PR, Japan, Singapore, Indonesia, Australia, France, Germany, 
India, Ireland, South Korea, Portugal, Chinese Taipei, the United Kingdom and the United 
States. 
 
“Approximately 6,000 visitors are expected to view the display during the three-day 
exhibition. We believe a large number of CEPSI 2018’s 1,500 delegates and 4,500 trade 
visitors may also take advantage of the exhibition as a business matching platform.” 
 
CEPSI 2018 exhibition will be held from Sept 18th to 20th, 2018 at the Kuala Lumpur 
Convention Centre. 
 
“CEPSI 2018 will therefore be the best avenue for companies to raise their brand awareness, 
market their products and services, as well as find potential business partners,” said Roslan. 
 
TNB is hosting CEPSI 2018 from September 17th to 22nd on behalf of the Association of the 
Electricity Supply Industry of East Asia and Western Pacific (AESIEAP). The last time TNB 
hosted CEPSI was in 1996.  
 
Since its inception in 1976 in Hong Kong SAR, CEPSI has grown in stature as a key 
international meeting point for power industry companies, utility leaders, industry 
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professionals and experts from all over the world to exchange ideas and learn from one 
another. 
 
Themed “Reimagining Utility of the Future”, CEPSI 2018 will focus on the current scenario of 
how the electricity supply industry is transforming in response to the emergence and 
convergence of technology disruptions, economic shifts, evolving sustainability and 
regulatory requirements, and increasing customer expectations. 
 
Companies interested to join CEPSI 2018 as exhibitors are advised to contact the organiser 
at exhibition@cepsi2018kl.org or visit CEPSI 2018 website at www.cepsi2018kl.org. Spaces 
are limited and will be granted on a first come first serve basis. 
 
 

Released in Kuala Lumpur on August 12, 2018 at 4.15pm 
 

Kindly forward all press enquiries Nor Hanim Idris at 019-2617617 /  
Norfadzilah Sha’ary at 019-3369681 or email us at media@tnb.com.my 


